West Virginia

Purchasing Division

The following documentation is an electronically-
submitted vendor response to an advertised
solicitation from the West Virginia Purchasing
Bulletin within the Vendor Self-Service portal at
wWVOASIS.gov. As part of the State of West Virginia’s
procurement process, and to maintain the
transparency of the bid-opening process, this
documentation submitted online is publicly posted
by the West Virginia Purchasing Division at
WVPurchasing.gov with any other vendor responses
to this solicitation submitted to the Purchasing
Division in hard copy format.
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Purchasing Division

2019 Washington Street East
Post Office Box 50130
Charleston, WV 25305-0130

State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response

Proc Folder : 513004

Solicitation Description : ADDENDUM 2 STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 2019 MAT.&DEL BY VENDOR

Proc Type : Central Master Agreement

Date issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation Response Version
2018-11-21 SR 0803 ESR11201800000002393 1
13:30:00
LVENDOR
VS0000011728
Stone Asphalt LLC
Solicitation Number: CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000041

Total Bid :

Comments:

$0.00

Response Date:

2018-11-20

Response Time: 12:22:56

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink

(304) 558-2402
crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

Signature on File

FEIN #

DATE

All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page :

1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-SR-001




Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Total Or Contract Amount
1 STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 0.00000 EA $0.000000 $0.00
2019 MAT.&DEL. BY THE LOW-BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600
STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 2019 MAT.&DEL. BY THE LOW-BID VENDOR PER ATTACHED PRICING PAGES

Extended Description :
AND INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FORM

Page: 2



Purchasing Divison State of West Virginia
2019 Washington Street East

e uotation
Post Office Box 50130 REFUSSKTGE Quota
Charleston, WV 25305-0130 19 — Highways

Proc Folder: 513004

Doc Description: ADDENDUM 2 STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 2019 MAT.&DEL

L BY VENDOR
Proc Type: Central Master Agreement _
Date Issued Solicitation Closes Solicitation No Version
2018-11-14 2018-11-21 CRFQ 0803 DOT1900000041 3
13:30:00
BID RECEIVING LOCATION
BID CLERK

DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

2019 WASHINGTON ST E

CHARLESTON wWv 25305
us

VENDOR

Vendor Name, Address and Telephone Number:

Stone Asphalt, LLC
P.O. Box 423
Reedsville, WV 26547
304-864-6426

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Crystal Rink

(304) 558-2402

crystal.g.rink@wv.gov

Signature X / , FEIN# 81-4994460

DATE 11/21/18

All offers subjéct to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation

Page : 1

FORM ID : WV-PRC-CRFQ-001




| ADDITIONAL INFORMATION:

THE STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA PURCHASING DIVISION FOR THE AGENCY, WEST VIRGINIA DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS, IS SOLICITING

BIDS TO ESTABLISH AND OPEN-END CONTRACT FOR STONE, AGGREGATE, AND CINDERS TO BE DELIVERED BY THE VENDOR PER
THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTS.

INVOICE TO SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City WV99999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 0.00000 EA
2019 MAT.&DEL. BY THE LOW-BID
Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #
11111600

Extended Description :

STONE AGGREGATE CINDERS 2019 MAT.&DEL. BY THE LOW-BID VENDOR PER ATTACHED PRICING PAGES AND INFORMATION
ATTACHMENT FORM

|SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 QUESTION DEADLINE 10AM EST 2018-11-13

Page: 2




DOT1900000041

Document Phase

Final

Document Descriptic
ADDENDUM 2 STONE AG
CINDERS 2019 MAT.&DEL

on
GREGATE
BY VENDOR

Page 3
of 3

ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS

See attached document(s) for additional Terms and Conditions




DESIGNATED CONTACT: Vendor appoints the individual identified in this Section as the
Contract Administrator and the initial point of contact for matters relating to this Contract.

4/ L’ Member

(Name Title)
Richard D. Stone Member
(Printed Name and Title)
P.O. Box 423 Reedsville, WV 26547
{Address)
304-864-6426 Fax: 304-864-4052

(Phone Number) / (Fax Number)

rstonepaving@frontiernet.net

(email address)

CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE: By signing below, or submitting documentation
through wvOASIS, [ certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entircty; that I understand
the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, offer

or proposal constitutes an offer to the State that cannot he uni laterally

or service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in th

withdrawn; that the product
e Solicitation for that

product or service, unless otherwisc stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and

conditions contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein

; that I am submitting this

bid, offer or proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute
and submit this bid, offer, or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that

I am authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and th
knowledge, the vendor has properly registered with any State agency t
registration.

Stone Asphalt, LLC

at to the best of my
hat may require

(Company)

///Lﬁ Richard D. Stone, Member

AAuthorized Si gnature) (Representative Name, Title)
Richard D. Stone, Member

(Printed Name and Title of Authorized Representative)

11/21/18

(Date)

304-864-6426 Fax: 304-864-4052

(Phone Number) (Fax Number)

Revised 06/08/2018




ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: CRFQ DOT1900000041

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: I hercby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

[] Addendum No. 1 [] Addendum No. 6
gAddendum No.2 [] Addendum No. 7
Addendum No. 3 [] Addendum No. 8
[ ] Addendum No. 4 [ ] Addendum No. 9
[[] Addendum No. 5 [] Addendum No. 10

I'understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

Stone Asphalt, LLC
Company

//L'ﬁ Richard D. Stone

AytHorized Si gnature

11/21/18
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 06/08/2018




INFORMATION ATTACHMENT FOI‘RM
Vendor’s Storage Sites -~ REQUIRED TO BE SUBMITTED WITH BID
2019 Stone and Aggregate - Material and Delivery by Vendor ONLY

VENDOR NAME

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.
A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor's Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment Form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all W¥DOH locations bid, A separate Information

Attachment Form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply (e.g. Quarry location if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

Cinders

c) SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

i er
Maidsville, WV

d) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage s#tes.
Stons-Asphalt-LLC
164 V.I.P. Drive
Masontown, WV 26542




Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Stone Asphalt, LLC
|
F.Q.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 4 2019
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton)
Contract Description Quantity DOH F.O.B.- DOH
ltem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site Storage Site
DODDRIDGE COUNTY | CINDERSZ]
AA  |CINDERS 2000 Smithburg 28.40
HARRISON COUNTY
AA  |CINDERS 2000 Tunnel APD-50 24.10
AA  |CINDERS 1000 Lost Creek I-79 26.30
AA  [CINDERS 3500 Gore 25.20
AA  [CINDERS 1000 Saltwell 22.50
MARION COUNTY
AA  [CINDERS 3500 Fairmont 23.00
AA  |CINDERS 1500 Mannington 2545
MONONGALIA COUNTY
AA  [CINDERS 3000 Ridgedale, US 119 S 18.75
AA  |CINDERS 2000 Pentress 23.00
AA  |CINDERS 2000 Goshen Road I-79 21.25
PRESTON COUNTY
AA  [CINDERS 4000 Albright 19.50
AA  |CINDERS 3000 Fellowsville 21.50
AA  |CINDERS 3000 Aurora 23.25
AA  [CINDERS 3000 Terra Alta 2310
AA  [CINDERS 3000 Bruceton Mills 24.00
AA  |CINDERS 3500 Coopers Rock |-68 24.50
AA  [CINDERS 1500 Masontown 19.00
TAYLOR COUNTY
AA  |CINDERS 3000 Grafton 24.00




Pricing Page Schedule VENDOR NAME Stone Asphalt, LLC

F.O.B. Division's Storage Site - DISTRICT 7 2019
Estimated Location of Bid Price ($/Ton)
Contract Description Quantity DOH F.O0.B. - DOH
ltem of Aggregate (TONS) Storage Site Storage Site
|
BRAXTON COUNTY | CINDERS
AA  |CINDERS 1500 Gassaway NO BID
AA  [CINDERS 1000 Heaters NO BID
AA  [CINDERS 1200 Burnsville I-79 NO BID
AA  |CINDERS 1200 Coon Knob [-79 NO BID
GILMER COUNTY
AA  |CINDERS | 2000 Glenville Headquarters] | NOBID
BARBOUR COUNTY
AA  [CINDERS 6000 Philippi 23.50
AA  [CINDERS 1500 Bellington 22.50
LEWIS COUNTY
AA  |CINDERS 2000 Bendale, Weston Hdgtrs NO BID
AA  |CINDERS 1000 Mudlick APD 33 NO BID
UPSHUR COUNTY
AA  [CINDERS 6000 Buckhannon Mudlick Lot NO BID
AA  |CINDERS 1500 Kanawha Head NO BID
WEBSTER COUNTY
AA  |CINDERS 2000 Parcoal NO BID
AA  [CINDERS 1000 Big Ditch Lane NO BID
AA  |CINDERS 1250 Hacker Valley NO BID




West Virginia Ethics Commission
) \
SRS

|
Sr 58
*5; {i}é%ﬁ'ﬁ* E:

Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts

Pursuant to W. va. Codo § 6D-1-2, a state agency may not enter into a contract, or a series of related
contracts, that hasthave an actual or estimated value of $1 million or more until the business entity submits
to the contracting state agency a Disciosure of Interested Parties to the applicable contract. In addition,
the business entity awarded a contract is vbligated to submit a supple%mental Disclosure of Interested
Parties reflecting any new or differing interested parties to the contract within 30 days fallowing the
completion or termination of the applicable contract.

For purposes of complying with these requirements, the following definitions apply:

‘Business entity” means any entity recognized by law through which business is conducted, including &
sole proprieiorship, partnership or corperation, but does not include publicly traded companies listed on a
national or infernational stock exchange.

“Interested party” or “Interested parties” means:

(1) A business entity performing work or service pursuant to, or in furtherance of, the applicable contract,
including specifically sub-contractors; ‘T

(2) the person(s) who have an ownership interest equal to or greater than 25% in the business entity
performing work or service pursuant to. or in furtherance of, the applicable contract. (This subdivision
does not apply to a publicly traded company); and

(3) the person or business entity, if any, that served as a compensated broker or intermediary to actively
facilitate the applicable contract or negotiated the terms of the.apphcabiq‘ contract with the state agency.
(This subdivision does not apply to persons or business entities performing legal services related to
the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract.)

“State agency” means a board, commission, office, department or other agency in the executive, judicial
or legislative branch of state government, including publicly funded institutions of higher education:

Provided, that for purposes of W. Va. Code § BD-1-2, the West Virginia Investment Management Board
shall not be deemed a state agency nor subject to the requirements of that provision.

The contracting business entity must complete this form and submit it to the')Jcontracting state agency prior
to contract award and to complete another form within 30 days of contract ompletion or termination.

This form was created by the State of West Virginia Ethics Commission, 210 Brooks Sireel, Suite 300,

Charleston, WV 25301-1804. Telephone: (304)558-0664; fax: (304)568-21 9, e-maif: athuce i o
website: vy eihucs. vy ey,

Rovised June 8, 2018



West Virginia Ethics Commission
Disclosure of Interested Parties to Contracts

(Required by W. Va. Code § 6D-1-2)

Name of Contracting Business Entity: Stone Asphalt, LLC

Address: FL.O. Box 423 Reedsville, WV 26547

Name of Authorized Agent: Richard D. Stone

Address: P O Box 423 Reedsville, WV 26547

Contract Number: CREQ 0803DOT 1900000041

Governmental agency awarding contract: WVDOT

Contract Description:

elive

00 Check here if this is a Supplemental Disclosure

List the Names of Interested Parties to the contract which are known or reasonably anticipated by the contracting business

entity for each category below (affach additional pages if necessary): i

1. Subcontractors or other entities performing work or service under the

ontract

#Check here if none, otherwise kst entity/individual names below,

2. Any person or entity who owns 25% or more of contracting entity (not a plicabie to pubilicly traded entities)
[ Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

3. Any person or entity that facilitated, or negotiated the terms of, the
services related to the negotiation or drafting of the applicable contract)

0 Check here if none, otherwise list entity/individual names below.

Signature: //%/'—

Notary Verification

State of_Nf’&J ‘\f"! { L}[ nig
L Richard O S

, County of | P('('?,S‘i'ér\

pplicable contract (exciuding legal

Date Signed: 11/20/18

 the authorized agent of the contracting business

entity listed above, being duly sworn, acknowledge that the Disclosure

penalty of perjury.

Taken, sworn to and subscribed before me this

herein is being made under oath and under the

day of _[\OVehber 201K,

\ .
LAyl h

To be completed State Agency:
Date Received by State Agency:

Notary Public's

Date submitted to Ethics Commission:

OFFICIAL SEAL

Governmental agency submitting Disclosure:

NOTARY PUBLIC
STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA

L EELYA WEILG

Revisad Juné b-5018
endsyiie, ‘Mest Virginia 26547
Expires Fab. 3, 2020

A AT,




STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTS: Under W. Va. Code § 5-22-1(j), the contracting public entity shall not award a
construction contract to any bidder that is known to be in default on any monetary obligation owed to the state or a
political subdivision of the state, including, but not limited to, obligations related to payroll taxes, property taxes, sales and
use taxes, fire service fees, or other fines or fees. ‘

\
EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to chapter
elsven of the W. Va. Code, workers' compensation premiuin, pemit fee or environmentai fee or assessment and the matter has
not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or egreement and the vendor Is not in default of any of the
provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Dobt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its political
subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulteq workers' compensation premium, penalty
or other assessment prasently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the siate or‘ any of its political subdivisions, Including
any Interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers’ fund or being
in policy defautt, as defined in W. Va, Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintaln mandatory wcrktu' compensation coverage, or failure to
fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An employer s not In employer default if it has entsred
into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner and remains in compliance with the obligations under the
repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, parinership, association, limited liability company or any other
form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage, awnership or contract through
which the party has a relationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor sa that th party will actually or by effect receive or
control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from performance of a r contract with the party receiving an
amaunt that meets or axcasd five percent of the total contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor's authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for faise swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that: (1) for construction contracts, the vendor is not in default on
any monetary obligation owed to the state or a political subdivision of the slﬁ‘te. and (2} for all other contracts,
that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined above and that neither vendor nor any related
party are in employer default as defined above, unless the dabt or employér default is permitted under the

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SiGNATURE: ‘

Vendor's Name: Stone Asphalt, LLC
Authorized Signature: //4 — Date! _11/20/18
state of_\\|¢ Sl \[ I( djn nid
County of Ph S , to-wit:
Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this ;zi}fday of _N Nemher ; 20]&.
My Commission expires Yr% b. 2 4 20_6_
AFFIX SEAL HERE NOTARY PUBLIC J'/\J\ (\_ | s \, L%L(“ (’?u
= . F@Z{t - Pirchasing Afidavit (Revised 01/19/2018)
‘I![EST \.’IA.!-EGiNIA
viie, Wast Virginia 26547

Expires Feb. 3, 2020
A e
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CONTRACTOﬁ LICENSE

Authorized by the
West Virginia Contractor Licensing Board

Number: WV055798
Classification:
GENERAL ENGINEERING
ASPHALT
DEMOLITION
STONE ASPHALT LLC
DBA STONE ASPHALT LLC
PO BOX 423
REEDSVILLE, WV 26547
Date Issued Expiration Date
JANUARY 19, 2018 JANUARY 19, 2019

4
f—— | e
Auyfiorized &oxﬁpany Signature Chair, West Virginia Contractor
Licensing Board

M)ARD This license, or a copy thereof, must be posted in a conspncujuus place at every construction site where work is being
15¢

performed. This license number must appear in all advertisements, on all bid submissions and on all fully executed

’ and binding contracts. This license cannot be assigned or transferred by licensee. Issued under provisions of West
A A A A A A A A < Virginia Code, Chapter 21, Article 11.




) .
1
YAQ Erie CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE e LD Bior
() ® i

& l nsurance — THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY —

Home Office + 100 Erie Insurance Place » Erie, Pennsyivania 16530 « 814.870.2000

Toll free 1.800.458.0811 + Fax 814.870.3126 « www.erieinsurance.com

NAME AND ADDRESS OF AGENCY RIZER GROUP AGENT'S NO. G EFIIEINS A G COVERAGF
o 0.: G _ERIE INSURANI il
13823 GRANT ST GG1265 ,gp,:_ E EHIEIN%%%%%EPH%%&% é" BASUALLLY}CA)M?AN&
) K o icable
NEW SPRINGFIELD, OH 44443 O B S HANCE EXCHANC Ein-rat ( ° joRicaD
| Go.. F|ERIE INSUBANCE COMPANY OF NEW YORK
— (330)549-5620 This certificate is issued for information purposes only and confers |
NAME AND ADDRESS OF NAMED INSURED no rights on the certificate holder. It does not affirmatively or
negatively amend, extend, or otherwise alter the terms, exclusions
Stone Asphalt, LLC jand conditions of insurance coverage contained in the policy(ies)
S Holdi LLC indicated below. The terms and conditions of the policy(ies) yovern
tone Holdings, LL the insurance coverage as applied to any given situation, Limits
P.O. Box 423 fshown may have been reduced by claims paid. This certificate of
; insurance does not constitute a contract hetween the issuing
Reedsville, WV 26547 insurer(s), authorized representative or producer and the
certificate holder.J
This ig to certify that policies, as indicated by the Policy Number below, are in force for the Named Insured at the time that the Certificate is being issued.
R THPE OF MsuRaNGE poucrwuwseR | ERHERATRERNE | PSR RERTaN I LMTS o BT T T
D'[X]|GENERAL LIABILITY 5/1/18 5/1/19 EACH OCCURRENCE |5 1,000,000
| (X] COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY| Q415150518 [ ‘ FIRE DAMAGE (e s 1,000,000
' (] cuams maok 0CCUR | MED EXP iAny One Person) | g 5,000
. | ! ‘ PERSONAL & ADV. INJURY's 1,000,000
N : GENERALAGGREGATE s 2,000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: ‘ ‘ PBODUGTE-CDMPIUPAGGIS 2,000,000
poucy (X7 provect [ ] toc| .f
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY . -
DIl 7 “any auTo (OWNED. HIRED, Q415150518 ' S/1/18 /1719 ?&%‘}l{"ﬂg‘sl;%m Js
; NON-OWNED) BODIYINJURY |
| [ ownep _(EACHACCIDENT) ~_|§
[X] HReD | | | PROPERTY DAMAGE  |$
| |X] non-owNED - "BODILYINJURYAND
s PROPERTY DAMAGE
[ ] arace ! | chnfgmgm ls 1,000,000
D[ X]|EXCESS LIABILITY ‘ EACHOCCURRENCE | $ 1,000,000
X ocourrence ‘ Qesal/onie i SR ‘ SR AGBREGATE  [s 1,000,000
| | Revenmion s 0 ‘ ; $
| |
| WORKERS COMPENSATION & | ! F STATUTORY
Ei EMPLOYERS LIABILITY Q89 0103955 /1718 5/1/19 BUDILY’ ACCIDENT  § 1,000,000 EACH ACCIDENT
| ‘ INJURY, DISEASE  $ 1,000,000 poLicy umir
‘ BY ‘ DISEASE ~ § 1,000,000 eacH empLoveE
OTHER ‘ |
!
| | |
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS/LOCATIONS/VEHICLES/EXCLUSIONS ADDED BY ENDORSEMENT/SPECIAL PROVISIONS
State of West Virginia is named as Additional Insured.

CANCELLATION: SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIV-
ERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the
terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer
rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

[NAME AND ADDRESS OF CERTIFICATE HOLDER N

State of West Virgina AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

1900 Kanawha Blvd. E Il I . .

Building 5 A < % R LA L . »

Charleston, WV 25305 < /{C & ( ((- AL (e
EIG6230 8/11 Bt A




